
99 

 

The Leader is one whose whole being (personality) is 
fortified by: the love of God, the love of people and the 
love for the world. 
   

Secretariat 
 
Introduction 
 
As committed leaders, dedicated to promoting and 
living the Foundational Charism ourselves, we have 
understood that Cursillo is not something that we do; it 
is something that we live, simply, because to live 
Cursillo is to live the Gospel. 
 
The two operational structures of the Movement, the 
School of Leaders and the Secretariat are indivisible, 
each one is dependent on the other and neither can 
function properly without the other.  It is from the 
School of Leaders that the members of the Secretariat 
are nominated and then it is the School that supports the 
work of the Secretariat. 
 

growth of the Movement and its development would 
require some structures to preserve the essence of 

Bonnín, Secretariats) 
 

structures overwhelming the Charism. In other words, 
would the structures choke the spirit of Cursillo. 
Hopefully, this rollo will help us see how we can have 
Secretariats that are humble enough to avoid this 
possibility. 
 
There are 3 types of Secretariats in the US Cursillo; the 
Diocesan Secretariat, the Regional Secretariat, and the 
National Secretariat. This rollo will focus on the 
Diocesan Secretariat. 
 
The Diocesan Secretariat  A Service Unit for the 
Movement 
 

serve those who serve most and best.  In this sense, a 
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laypeople  men and women  and which takes the 
Cursillos as an authentic and apostolic plan, to be 
programmed and carried through with the idea of the 
greatest efficacy of souls in mind.  (Structure of Ideas) 
 
 
The Secretariat can be described as that group of leaders 

 priests and lay persons who, presented by the Cursillo 
community (the School), commissioned by the 
hierarchy (Bishop) to orientate, animate, and serve the 
Cursillo Movement, so that it might be all and only that 
which it ought to be.  (Fundamental Ideas, 1974 edition) 
 
The Diocesan Secretariat is a group of leaders who are 
responsible for the proper functioning of the School of 
Leaders and the whole Movement in an area.  It ensures 
that the School fulfills what it is commissioned to in 
each of its essential phases of the Movement; the 
Precursillo, Cursillo, and Postcursillo.  It ensures the 
unity in the message and the freedom of the Cursillistas.  

 
 

- The Secretariat exists in order 
to: 
 

 simplify, 
 facilitate and, 
 make possible the living of everything that is 

fundamentally Christian, and 
 to be the guardians of the purity of the Cursillo 

Charism. 
 
As such, the members of the Secretariat are the servants 
of the servants; their role is to be one of simple service 
to the Movement.  Unfortunately, all too often, it 
becomes a place of prestige, power, and control instead 
of the place where committed leaders act together to 
find ways to guide the Movement, themselves being 
leaven as the Cursillistas are leaven in the world. 
 
In the Name of Jesus 
 
The following quotes come from the book, In the Name 
of Jesus, Reflections on Christian Leadership by Henri 
Nouwen. 
 

is that its leaders constantly gave in to the temptation of 
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power, political power, military power, economic power 
or moral and spiritual power, even though they 
continued to speak in the Name of Jesus who didn't 
cling to his divine power, but emptied himself and 
became as we are.  The temptation to consider power a 
useful instrument in the proclamation of the Gospel is 

 
 

hard task of love.  It seems easier to be God than to love 
God, easier to control people than to love people, easier 

leadership in which power is constantly abandoned in 
favor of love.  It is a true spiritual leadership.  
Powerlessness and humility in the spiritual life do not 
refer to people who have no spine and let everyone else 
take decisions for them.  They refer to people who are 
so deeply in love with Jesus that they are ready to 
follow Him wherever he guides them, always trusting 
that with Him they will find li  
 
 
These quotes by Henri Nouwen, speak very clearly of 
the danger but also of the solution for those who serve 
the Movement in a leadership position, especially, the 
Secretariat. 
 
 

 
A Diocesan Cursillo Movement shall be considered in 
line with the Charism if, in its conduct and 
implementation of the essence, purpose, and method of 
Cursillo, it fosters unity through the creative expression 
of the mentality of the Founder.  The following is the 
criteria for an authentic Movement in a diocese. This 
criterion is outlined in the Articles of Operation. 
 

 To have the approval of the local Bishop to have 
the Cursillo Movement in the diocese. Why? Because as 
a Movement in the Church, Cursillo falls under the 
authority of the local Bishop and he is the one who 
gives approval for Cursillo to function in his diocese. 
 
 

 To develop and implement a viable Cursillo 
Apostolic Plan for the diocesan Movement that 
addresses the three phases, (Precursillo, 3-Day Cursillo, 
Postcursillo) and the operational structures, (Secretariat 
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that ensures Cursillo is always moving towards its 
Charism. 
 

 To affiliate with the Regional and National 
Secretariats. Why? Because we are united in the one 
Body of Christ through friendship.  
 

 To have prepared and adopted a set of By-Laws. 
Why? So the School and Secretariat know and 
understand how they will serve the Cursillistas in the 
diocese. 

 To have a School of Leaders responsible for 
implementing all phases of the method properly and 
with particular attention to the Postcursillo. Why? So 
that this group of friends will individually and 

to the person through friendship. 
 To have a small representative body, lay and 

clergy, selected from the active participants in the 
School of Leaders, called the Diocesan Secretariat. 
Why? So that as a Service Unit, all their work will be 
converted to service for the good of the Cursillistas and 
at the same time safeguard the purity of the method and 
Charism. 
 

 To make an annual report to the Bishop, 
Regional Coordinator, and National Cursillo Center. 

evangelization efforts and to communicate any needs 
there may be in the diocesan movement to the Regional 
Coordinator. 
 
In addition, the Diocesan Secretariat should: 
 

 constantly be deepening their understanding of 

the good of the entire Movement. 
 

 make all decisions for the good of the Movement 
bearing in mind always that in Cursillo; all that is done, 
is done with the person as the primary focus. 
 

 remember that although they are responsible for 
all aspects of the Movement, it does not need to do 
everything; the Secretariat should delegate pertinent 
tasks to their committees (Precursillo, 3-Day Cursillo, 
Postcursillo). 
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The Secretariat and the School of Leaders never come 
together simply to do something, but always first and 
foremost to be something together: 
 

 to be friends, because friendship is foundational 
in Cursillo, 

 to be servants, because as leaders we have 
decided to serve Christ and His Church through the gift 
of Cursillo, 

 to be authentic, because to be the true person 
God created brings real meaning to our life, 
 

 to be apostles, because in baptism we were sent 
 

 
 to be Christian, because Christ and His grace is 

what leads the way to the Father. 
 
As Cursillo leaders, as Secretariat members, we must 
keep the flame of the vision of the Founder burning 
brightly to illuminate the path that leads to Christ, the 
path to eternity. 
 
 
The vision of the Founder, our vision, must extend 
outside the boundaries of our parishes, it must extend 
outside the boundaries of the diocese, it must extend 
outside the boundaries of our cities, it must be extended 
to every person that Christ places in our moveable 
square meter (environment) at this exact moment, so 
that ALL may know that God loves them! 
 
Dangers to Avoid 
 

 The Charism of Cursillo does not change when 
Secretariat members change. 

 
that of a board of directors; if this happens, then it can 
only be said that it is far removed from its Christian 
context. 

 Personal agendas or ideas that go against the 
Gospel, teachings of the Church, or the Charism of 
Cursillo must be avoided even if they are well intended. 
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 Secretariat positions should not be filled by 
default.  Leaders need to understand that serving in 
Cursillo is a vocation  it is a call to serve. 
 

 Service does not end when a Secretariat member 
finishes their term.  If Cursillo is your vocation, you will 
continue to attend School of Leaders, Group Reunion, 
and Ultreya. 
 

 There is nothing secret about Cursillo, therefore, 
the Secretariat needs to be transparent in their 
communication with the School of Leaders and the 
Cursillo community. 

 Personalities will sometimes get in the way. 
Learn to work with each other.  We are a Christian 
community serving one another in love and friendship. 
 
 
The Diocesan Secretariat is Composed of Laity and 
Clergy 
 
The Bishop entrusts the whole Secretariat with the 
responsibility of promoting, developing and directing 
the Cursillo Movement in the diocese.  Most bishops 
prefer one Diocesan Secretariat made-up of the different 
language groups represented in Cursillo. The authority 
entrusted to the Secretariat by the local Bishop is to 
embrace, study, and promote the Charism of the 
Movement. 
 
The Secretariat members are nominated by the School 
of Leaders and selected by the current Diocesan 
Secretariat members through prayer and discernment.  
The Spiritual Advisor leads the Secretariat in prayer and 
discernment during the selection process.  The selection 
of Secretariat members places them able to be of greater 
service to the Movement. 
 
1. The Lay Director should always be a layperson 
responsible for the technique and methodology of 
Cursillo. The Lay Director creates and oversees the 
meeting agenda and ensures that all members fulfill 
their role of service. 
2. The Spiritual Advisor, always a priest, deacon or 
religious, is responsible for matters concerning doctrine 
and conscience. He is the link between the Secretariat 
and the local Bishop. His specific contributions to 

 

 trong không 
 ai

trong Cursillo 
   

  
, 

tham gia 
Ultreya. 

 i  
rõ ràng trong  

 

 
chung nhau. Chúng ta là 

 

  

 

trao phó cho 

hình thành 
khác nhau  trong Cursillo.   Giám 

trao cho  và 
  

Các thành 
 và  

.  Phong trào 
n phân 

 các thành vào 
  

  

1.  trách 
 

 

 
2. 

 liên quan 
 lý và  



105 

 

 
 
3. Chairperson of the School of Leaders determines 
the rollistas for the Doctrinal and Technique 
presentations for the School.  The Chairperson ensures a 
one-year study curriculum is setup and maintained for 
the School. 
 
4. Chairperson of the Precursillo ensures the 
selection and preparation of candidates who will live a 
Cursillo Weekend is properly implemented. The 
Chairperson will ensure that the Secretariat, person or 
group delegated by the Secretariat receives an 
application for each candidate that is properly filled.  
Ensure that the sponsor or group sponsoring the 
candidate knows him and has established a sincere 
friendship, to ensure a smooth transition from the 
Precursillo to the Postcursillo by way of the Cursillo 
Weekend. 
 
5. Chairperson of the 3-Day Cursillo ensures the 
facility and all the necessary elements and supplies are 
available for the Cursillo Weekend.  This Chairperson 
can also recommend members from the School of 
Leaders for the (Weekend) team to the Secretariat for 
approval. 
 
6. Chairperson of the Postcursillo ensures that 
every Cursillista within the Diocesan Movement has the 
opportunity to grow in their Fourth Day. This is 
accomplished by ensuring a link between the School of 
Leaders and the Ultreyas within the diocese. 
Furthermore, the Chairperson ensures the Ultreyas 
maintain their essence. The Chairperson is also 
responsible for determining and scheduling necessary 
Diocesan, Regional, and National workshops. 
 
 
7. Treasurer will manage financial matters and 
ensures the Diocesan Movement is financially solvent 
and that all local, regional and national obligations are 
met. 
 
8. Secretary will keep the minutes of all Secretariat 
meetings and distribute them promptly to anyone who 
should receive them.  Ensures all mailing lists are up-to-
date. 
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The Chairpersons for Precursillo, 3-Day Cursillo, and 
Postcursillo may create committees to assist with the 
work or service of that section.  The committee 
members communicate directly with the Chairperson.  
The committee members are not members of the 
Diocesan Secretariat. 
 
Meetings and Information 
 
During the meetings, all members contribute their ideas, 
concerns, questions, suggestions and solutions about any 
topic on the agenda. It is essential that information flows 
in all directions: with the School of Leaders, the Cursillo 
community and of course, among the members of the 
Secretariat. Remember, there are no secrets in Cursillo!  
 
The Secretariat by itself does not have any importance 
and even less important are the titles because only God 
is God. The only way the Secretariat will bear fruit for 
Christ and His Church, is through friendship; friendship 
between each member, with other Cursillistas and with 
Christ. This is the only way to live the essence, 
mentality, and method of Cursillo and achieve its 
purpose. 
Qualities and Attitudes of a Secretariat 
Prayer and Will 
 
We must believe in the power of our prayer when we 
call upon the Holy Spirit at the beginning of each 
Secretariat meeting. 
 
We must have the free desire (will) to want to follow 
Christ to reach God as individuals and as a Secretariat. 
All members must possess the supernatural qualities of 
Faith, Hope and Love. 
 
Know and Love the Movement 
 
It is not only about knowing the theory of Cursillo, but 
living faithfully its Mentality, understanding its Essence 

grace, reflect its Charism in order to be the reflection of 
this beautiful experience of God and His friendship for 
others. 
 
Usually before a Cursillista is selected as member of the 
Secretariat, that person has already demonstrated 
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enthusiasm, dedication, and a spirit of charity and 
therefore, has contributed to advancing the Movement. 
 
In knowing how the Movement should work, we will be 
able to see clearly what does not work. Ignorance of the 
mentality and purpose of Cursillo leads to unreasonable 
situations and impositions. The consequence is that we 
will want to use the purpose of Cursillo for our benefit 
instead of serving Christ and His Church. 
 
Intelligence and Common Sense 
 
It is important to use common sense to keep the 
Mentality of Cursillos alive without changing it, but 
always considering the realities and circumstances of 
each place and time. 
 
It is important to have a spirit of being Church and 
enough common sense to realize there are other ways 
for the person to encounter and follow Christ. Cursillo is 
not the only way or the only group that puts their trust in 
the Lord. The Founder believed that with this 
combination of common sense and a sense of Church, 

 
 
It is essential to use our God-given intelligence to know 
and understand who and what we are dealing with: 
Christ, the person, faith, hope, and love. Therefore, we 
should not take things too lightly, but always serve with 
joy and enthusiasm. 
 
Being True Leaders 
 
Consistency in Life  We must be honest individuals. 
Any person serving on the Secretariat or anywhere in 
the Movement, should lead a life consistent with what 
he preaches. This way, the leader will be admired and 
respected by the other Cursillistas without having to do 
anything special. His friendship and authentic way of 
life is enough to convince others because it will be 
Christ working through him. 
 
Ability to Dialogue and Understand  This is essential 
between the members of the Secretariat. To speak the 
truth with love must be, not only possible, but must 
make us feel grateful, and the differences between the 
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members must never break the friendship, nor diminish 
the will to reach an agreement. 
 
Spirit of Service  When a person gives their best to 
others from their heart in total freedom, they discover 
God in their inner most being and they become capable 
of seeing Christ in others. This is the Spirit of Service 
that every member of the Secretariat should strive to 
have. 
 
Be a Group Reunion 
 
Share your inner tripod of piety, study and action with 
each other so everyone will know everyone else and 
therefore, deepen friendship. Love each other because 
you are friends, not because you have a title. Friendship 
is not about a title; it is about the person. 
 
Be Observant 
 

we can serve them. Be aware of those with initiative and 
a good attitude and always encourage them because 
Cursillo needs them. Cursillo is not searching for perfect 
leaders, but for leaders with ideas and leaders with 
action. This is what the Founder would want, a mixture 
of both so they can complement each other. 
 
Have an Apostolic Plan 
 
 For promoting and encouraging Group Reunions 

since this is the core of the Method. 
 For promoting and implementing an effective 

School of Leaders. 
 For focusing on and emphasizing the importance 

of all three phases of the Method: Precursillo, 3-Day 
Cursillo and Postcursillo. 
 For ensuring Cursillo is what it should be, a 

Movement that helps people live in friendship with self, 
with Christ and with others. 
 
 
Be Diverse 
 
The Secretariat should integrate different kind of people 
to represent the reality of life to understand the different 
environments, their concerns, and their hopes. 
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Humble Heart 
 
A humble heart can overcome any problem, doubt, or 
stress in the Secretariat. A humble heart will help us 
recognize our limitations and be willing to forgive 
offenses through charity towards one another. The virtue 
of humility is essential when working in a group like the 
Secretariat. It increases faith and helps us see Christ in 
every person. 
 
Conclusion 
 
The members of the Secretariat should remember that 
the Lord has entrusted them with the responsibility of 
implementing the true Charism of Cursillo in the 

the Secretariat should coordinate individual 
contributions into a total effort in support of the 

all three phases Cursillo. 
 
It is quite clear that the spirit of the Secretariat should be 
the spirit of group reunion, which is based on friendship. 

dynamic reality within the greater community if it does 
not itself possess a true community spirit,
also the spirit of friendship). The literature goes on to 

own opinion are not only possible, but appreciated; 
where, upon finding differences, friendship will not 
suffer, nor willingness to come to an agreement; where, 
once a decision has been reached, all will be 
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